Bid Tab

Trash and Recycling Services

2:00 p.m., Thursday
November 3, 2011

Deffenbaugh Industries, | Waste Management of Waste Connections of
Inc Nebraska, Inc. Abe's Trash Service, Inc. Nebraska, Inc. Gretna Sanitation, Inc.
Total Annual Trash Bid $11,208.00 $11,400.00 $10,982.40 $9,696.00 $12,420.00
Total Annual Recycle Bid $5,640.00 $6,360.00 $5,460.00 $3,840.00 $10,188.00
Total Combined Trash & Recycle $16,848.00 $17,760.00 $16,442.40 $13,536.00 $22,608.00
Total Option 1 Bid No Bid $5,435.50 $6,227.75 No Bid No Bid
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Bid Tab

Trash and Recycling Services

Dx ies, Inc Waste Of Nebraska, Inc. Abe's Trash Service, Inc.
Trash Service
Location Name Address Container Size Frequency Monthly Charge Annual Charge Monthly Charge Annual Charge  Monthly Charge Annual Charge
Sarpy County Public Works 15100 S. 84th Street 4vd 1x $57.00 $684.00 $44.19 $530.28 $60.50 $726.00)
Sarpy County Public Works 15100 S. 84th Street 40 Yd Roll-Off  1x See on Call - See on Call - See on Call -
Sarpy County Jail 1208 Golden Gate Dr. 8Yd 3x $249.00 $2,988.00 $265.12 $3,181.44 $238.70 $2,864.40
Sarpy County Juvenile Center 9701 Portal Rd. 8Yd 1x $83.00 $996.00 $88.37 $1,060.44 $85.80 $1,029.60)
Sarpy County Sheriff's Office 8335 Platteview Rd. 2vd 1x $47.00 $564.00 $22.09 $265.08 $44.00 $528.00|
Sarpy County Courthouse 1210 Golden Gate Dr. 8Yd 3x $249.00 $2,988.00 $265.12 $3,181.44 $238.70 $2,864.40)
Sarpy County Courthouse 1261 Golden Gate Dr. 8Yd 1x $83.00 $996.00 $88.37 $1,060.44 $85.80 $1,029.60)
Sarpy County Courthouse Admin
Addition- Next to Building 1257 1210 Golden Gate Dr. 8Yd 2x $166.00 $1,992.00 $176.74 $2,120.88 $161.70 $1,940.40
Total $934.00 $11,208.00 $11,400.00 $10,982.40
On Call Pick Up Rates
On Call 2 Yard $25.00 $20.00 $25.00
On Call 4 Yard $35.00 $30.00 $25.00
On Call 8 Yard $45.00 $60.00 $29.00
On Call 40 Yard Roll-Off $125 Haul/$30 Disposal $275.00 $290.00
Recycle Service
Location Name | Address Container Size Frequency Monthly Charge Annual Charge Monthly Charge Annual Charge Monthly Charge Annual Charge
Sarpy County Public Works 15100 S. 84th Street 4vd 1x $50.00 $600.00 $31.18 $374.16 $40.00 $480.00|
Sarpy County Jail 1208 Golden Gate Dr. 8Yd 2x $90.00 $1,080.00 $124.71 $1,496.52 $90.00 $1,080.00
Sarpy County Juvenile Center 9701 Portal Rd. 6Yd 1x $50.00 $600.00 $46.76 $561.12 $50.00 $600.00
Sarpy County Sheriff's Office 8335 Platteview Rd. 8Yd 1x $50.00 $600.00 $62.35 $748.20 $60.00 $720.00)
Sarpy County Courthouse 1210 Golden Gate Dr. 8vYd 2x $90.00 $1,080.00 $124.71 $1,496.52 $90.00 $1,080.00)
Sarpy County Courthouse 1261 Golden Gate Dr. 6Yd 1x $50.00 $600.00 $46.76 $561.12 $50.00 $600.00
Sarpy County Courthouse Admin
Addition - Next to Building 1257 1210 Golden Gate Dr. 6Yd 2x $90.00 $1,080.00 $93.53 $1,122.36 $75.00 $900.00|
Total $5,640.00 $6,360.00 $5,460.00|
On Call Pick Up Rates
On Call 2 Yard Not Listed $15.00 $25.00
On Call 4 Yard Not Listed $20.00 $25.00
On Call 6 Yard Not Listed $30.00 $25.00
On Call 8 Yard Not Listed $40.00 $25.00
Option 1: Recycle Bins
Type Quantity Unit Price Extended Price  Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price ' Unit Price Extended Price
23 Gallon, No Lid 40 $56.50 $2,260.00 $59.45 $2,378.00
28.5 Quart 435 $7.30 $3,175.50 $8.85 $3,849.75
Option 1 Total No Bid $5,435.50 $6,227.75
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Bid Tab
Trash and Recycling Services

Waste Ci ions of

Inc.

Gretna Sanitation, Inc.

Trash Service

Location Name | Address Container Size Frequency Monthly Charge Annual Charge Monthly Charge Annual Charge
Sarpy County Public Works 15100 S. 84th Street 4Yd 1x $44.00 $528.00 $65.00 $780.00)
Sarpy County Public Works 15100 S. 84th Street 40 Yd Roll-Off  1x See on Call - See on Call -
Sarpy County Jail 1208 Golden Gate Dr. 8Yd 3x $215.00 $2,580.00 $276.00 $3,312.00
Sarpy County Juvenile Center 9701 Portal Rd. 8Yd 1x $77.00 $924.00 $92.00 $1,104.00)
Sarpy County Sheriff's Office 8335 Platteview Rd. 2Yd 1x $28.00 $336.00 $50.00 $600.00)
Sarpy County Courthouse 1210 Golden Gate Dr. 8Yd 3x $215.00 $2,580.00 $276.00 $3,312.00
Sarpy County Courthouse 11261 Golden Gate Dr. 8Yd 1x $77.00 $924.00 $92.00 $1,104.00)
Sarpy County Courthouse Admin
Addition- Next to Building 1257 1210 Golden Gate Dr. 8vd 2x $152.00 $1,824.00 $184.00 $2,208.00)
Total $9,696.00 $12,420.00)
On Call Pick Up Rates
On Call 2 Yard $28.00 $25.00
On Call 4 Yard $45.00 $32.00
On Call 8 Yard $60.00 $46.00
On Call 40 Yard Roll-Off $105 Haul/$28.40 Disp $325.00
Recycle Service
Location Name Address Container Size Frequency Monthly Charge Annual Charge Monthly Charge Annual Charge
Sarpy County Public Works 15100 S. 84th Street 4Yd 1x $22.00 $264.00 $65.00 $780.00)
Sarpy County Jail 1208 Golden Gate Dr. 8Yd 2x $65.00 $780.00 $184.00 $2,208.00
Sarpy County Juvenile Center 9701 Portal Rd. 6Yd 1x $32.00 $384.00 $81.00 $972.00)
Sarpy County Sheriff's Office 8335 Platteview Rd. 8vd 1x $41.00 $492.00 $92.00 $1,104.00]
Sarpy County Courthouse 1210 Golden Gate Dr. 8Yd 2x $65.00 $780.00 $184.00 $2,208.00)
Sarpy County Courthouse 1261 Golden Gate Dr. 6Yd 1x $32.00 $384.00 $81.00 $972.00)
Sarpy County Courthouse Admin
Addition - Next to Building 1257 1210 Golden Gate Dr. 6Yd 2x $63.00 $756.00 $162.00 $1,944.00)
Total $3,840.00 $10,188.00)
On Call Pick Up Rates
On Call 2 Yard $20.00 $25.00
On Call 4 Yard $40.00 $32.50
On Call 6 Yard $45.00 $40.50
On Call 8 Yard $50.00 $46.00
Option 1: Recycle Bins
Type Quantity Unit Price Extended Price  Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price
23 Gallon, No Lid 40
28.5 Quart 435
Option 1 Total No Bid No Bid

2:00 p.m., Thursday
November 3, 2011



